
APPROVED MINUTES of the Regular 
Meeting of the City Council of the City of Rye held in 
City Hall on March 20, 2013 at 8:00 P.M. 

 
PRESENT: 
 DOUGLAS FRENCH Mayor 
 LAURA BRETT 
 RICHARD FILIPPI 
 PETER JOVANOVICH  
 JULIE KILLIAN 
 CATHERINE F. PARKER 
 JOSEPH A. SACK 
 Councilmembers 
 
ABSENT: None 
 
 
1. Pledge of Allegiance 
 
 Mayor French called the meeting to order and invited the Council to join in the Pledge of 
Allegiance. 
 
 
2. Roll Call 
 
 Mayor French asked the City Clerk to call the roll; a quorum was present to conduct 
official city business. 
 
 
3. General Announcements 
 
 The Rye Golf Club Commission and membership want to know the status of the District 
Attorney’s investigation.  The Commission wants to write a letter to the District Attorney asking 
for an update on what is happening. 
 
 
4. Presentation on the current options for a Deer Management pilot program  
 
 City Manager Pickup said that the presentation will be on a pilot program that the City 
might implement by partnering with the Westchester County Parks Department and Jay Heritage 
Center.  Councilwoman Parker provided background information on the impetus for a deer 
management program in the City.  John Baker, Director of Conservation for the Westchester 
County Department of Parks, Recreation and Conservation, made a presentation about the 
County Deer Management Program that was started in 2008 as a result of a Citizens’ Task Force 
focusing on the impact of deer and forest regeneration.  The consensus of the Task Force was 
that the best way to manage deer in Westchester County was through hunting.  The goal of the 
program is to reduce the deer population in order to attain forest regeneration in the safest way 
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possible. Mr. Baker provided an overview of the how the program works in County Parks, 
including requirements for hunters and time frames for hunts in various County parks.  He said 
that deer management is a regional effort and requires cooperation among different entities 
because it cannot be solved in one location. He added that utilizing the Marshlands and Jay 
Heritage properties for a deer management program presents a management challenge because it 
is not a huge property and is boarded on one side by Greenhaven and the other side by the golf 
course. 
 
 Several people spoke in favor of implementing the deer management program in Rye, 
including:  Norman Cooper, Alison Heaton, Anne Dooley, Joann Redding, Mitch Burns, Stefan 
Auburie, Cecil Klur, Peggy Conner, Chris Cohen and Patrick Lemon, but some did not think the 
program went far enough to deal with the deer problem in Rye.  Chris Molinari spoke against the 
program, saying that bow hunting is both inhumane and wasteful. 
 
 City Manager Pickup said there are manpower issues with the County program and the 
Police Department that must be addressed and it is hoped that the issue will come back to the 
Council for continued discussion in May. 
 
 
5. Draft unapproved minutes of the Workshop on Land Use held on February 27, 2013, the 

Special Meeting of the City Council held March 4, 2013, and the regular meeting of the 
City Council held March 6, 2013   

 
 Councilwoman Parker made a motion, seconded by Councilman Filippi and unanimously 
carried, to approve the minutes of the workshop on Land Use held on February 27, 2012, as 
submitted. 
 
 Councilman Jovanovich made a motion, seconded by Councilman Filippi and 
unanimously carried, to approve the minutes of the Special meeting of the City Council held on 
March 4, 2012, as submitted. 
 
 Councilman Jovanovich made a motion, seconded by Councilwoman Brett and 
unanimously carried, to approve the minutes of the regular meeting of the City Council held on 
March 6, 2013, as submitted. 
 
 
6. Mayor’s Management Report    
             ●  Capital Projects Update  
 

 Sluice Gate – City Manager Pickup reported that testing has been completed and passed 
the first set of acceptance testing.  The next phase will be training for DPW and computer 
training for other staff.  When it is complete, the City will be able to take complete 
ownership of the property.  Staff may come back to the Council regarding additional 
monitoring sites. 

 Station Plaza – City Manager Pickup said that the first step necessary to address the 
conditions at Station Plaza would be to enter into a long-term lease agreement with Metro 
North.  A cooperative effort would be required in order to make substantial 
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improvements.  The area needs drainage and lighting improvements, and roadway 
redesign and rebuilding in order for the area to function in a safe manner. 

 1037 Boston Post Road – Corporation Counsel Wilson reported that the Phase II testing 
results have come back.  Everything is fine with respect to soil but there is some concern 
regarding VOCs (volatile organic compounds) inside the building in the basement area.  
Once the last piece is cleared, a closing date can be set. 

 Boston Post Road resurfacing – A meeting was held with Con Edison officials regarding 
pole locations in the area of the Boston Post Road that is due to be paved during the 
summer.  The lane width is 9 ½ feet and it was hoped that the curb line could be moved 
to extend the lane width.  Options for moving the poles or burying the lines were 
discussed as well as the possibility of it being done prior to the start of paving. 

  
 

Councilman Sack said he wanted to raise another issue under this topic.  He said he has 
serious concerns regarding how the City Manager has handled certain issues in the City.  He 
believes there is a crisis of confidence and the Council must take some action and address the 
problems.  Councilman Jovanovich suggested that a way of resolving the situation would be for 
Councilman Sack to make a motion to dismiss the City Manager because the Council’s role in 
managing the City is to hire and fire the City Manager.  Councilwomen Parker, Brett and Killian 
felt that the best way would be to sit down with the City Manager and discuss the Council’s 
concerns with him in order to provide their feedback.  Mayor French said the Council should 
meet with the City Manager and set a formal review process. 
 
 
             ●  Legal Update 
 
 There was nothing reported under this topic. 
 
 
7. Discussion of the City of Rye’s FOIL procedures 
 
 City Manager Pickup said there is a proposal to centralize the City’s FOIL process which 
requires changes to procedures and work flow.  He said that issues have been identified that 
impact the City’s ability to respond to FOIL requests in a timely fashion and the City must invest 
time and resources into records management.  One of the issues with large requests is the need to 
search multiple locations and systems for records.  It is hoped that the work flow process in the 
new procedures will facilitate meeting deadlines.  Corporation Counsel Wilson gave an overview 
of the new system that is being developed with an electronic intake form that will provide 
requestors with a tracking number, but will ask them to limit their requests to one per form.  She 
summarized the proposed three changes to the current procedures:  centralize the initial requests 
to one records access officer (City Clerk); make it easier to submit FOIL requests electronically 
on the City website; and, changing the appeals process to make the City Manager the appellate 
officer.  There was a discussion among the members of the Council about the need to respond to 
FOIL requests in a timely manner; returning the City Council to the role of Appellate Officer; the 
possibility of needing extra staff to deal with FOIL requests; and, centralizing the procedure to 
one records access officer.  It was suggested that the new process should be reviewed by the 
Council in three months.  The proposed changes in the FOIL procedures will be brought back to 
the Council for further discussion. 
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 Members of the public commenting on the proposed changes to FOIL procedures 
included John Carey, Leon Sculti and Jim Amico.  Their comments included a suggestion of 
delegating the Appellate role; disagreement with the proposed records access and appellate 
officers; and following the FOIL laws. 
 
8. Consideration to amend the resolution to televise all public meetings of the City Council 

including regular meetings, special meetings, and workshops 
 
 City Manager Pickup said the proposed resolution tightens up language in the previous 
Resolution adopted by the Council in September 2009 in order to clarify expectations for special 
meetings.  There was a discussion among the members of the Council about possible changes in 
the language in the proposed Resolution, a version of a Resolution submitted by John Carey, or if 
there was even a necessity to adopt an updated Resolution.  No action was taken to adopt the 
proposed Resolution. 
 
 
9. Residents may be heard on matters for Council consideration that do not appear on the agenda 
 
 Alisa Cagle, CSEA DPW representative, read a statement outlining the work done for the 
City on behalf of the union employees of the Department of Public Works, who have been 
negotiating a new contract for the past 15 months and are now in mediation.  She asked the 
Council for their support in contract negotiations so a fair agreement can be reached. 
 
 John Staino, CSEA Local 860 President, said that the members of the City DPW union 
are being reasonable in their negotiations and are asking for a contract that respects their work. 
 
 Jim Amico read a letter he had written regarding trust and said that a serious conversation 
must be had about how business is done in Rye and the Council has failed in its oversight of the 
City Manager.  Anne Dooley, said that Mr. Amico does not speak for all in Rye and that many in 
Rye think highly of the Council for their dedication to the City.  In rebuttal, Mr. Amico said the 
Council should hold itself to a higher standard. 
 
 Linda Lefkowitz spoke about the report issued on the Golf Club investigation.  She also 
asked if an announcement would be sent out from the Golf Club inviting people to join and 
announcing the fees for the upcoming year. 
 
 The Council held a discussion about authorizing the funds necessary for Bill Breen to 
complete the final accounting that had not been completed at the time the report was issued.  
Corporation Wilson said that the actual amount would depend on the detail needed by the City’s 
insurance carrier but the estimate was $10,000 to $12,000. 
 
 Councilman Sack made a motion, seconded by Councilwoman Brett, to adopt the 
following Resolution: 
 
  RESOLVED, that the City Council of the City of Rye hereby authorizes the City 
Comptroller to transfer $12,000 from the General Fund Contingent Account to the City Council 
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Legal Services Account to fund Bill Breen’s final financial analysis related to the Rye Golf Club 
investigation. 
 
ROLL CALL: 
AYES: Mayor French, Councilmembers Brett, Filippi, Jovanovich, 

Killian, Parker and Sack  
NAYS:  None 
ABSENT:  None 
 
The Resolution was adopted by a 7-0 vote 
 
 Leon Sculti said that the Golf Commission had taken a no confidence vote against the 
City Manager. 
 
 Sis D’Angelo spoke about the Schubert, Golf Club and Dapolite issues and called the City 
Manager a liar. 
 
 
10. One appointment to the Conservation Commission/Advisory Council for a three-year 

term, by the Mayor with Council approval 
 
 Councilman Jovanovich made a motion, seconded by Councilman Filippi and 
unanimously approved, to appoint Erik Nimlos to the Conservation Commission/Advisory 
Council for a three-year term expiring on January 1, 2016. 
 
 

***************************** 
 

 Additionally, another appointment was made to the temporary Rye Golf Club Strategic 
Committee. 
 
 Mayor French made a motion, seconded by Councilman Filippi and unanimously 
approved to appoint Bill Gates to the Rye Golf Club Strategic Committee. 
 
 
11. Bid Award for Street Materials (Bid #2-13) 
            Roll Call.  

 
 Councilman Filippi made a motion, seconded by Councilwoman Parker, to adopt the 
following Resolution: 
 

      
 RESOLVED, that Bid #2-13, Street 
Materials, is hereby awarded to Putnam Materials 
for crushed stone and graded processed stone; to 
Peckham Materials Corp. for sub-base, binder 
course (both types), shim course, top course (both 
types) and curb mix; and to Byram Concrete LLC 
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for class A concrete and controlled density fill, as 
the bidders offering the lowest price. 

 
 
ROLL CALL: 
AYES: Mayor French, Councilmembers Brett, Filippi, Jovanovich, 

Killian, Parker and Sack  
NAYS:  None 
ABSENT:  None 
 
The Resolution was adopted by a 7-0 vote 

 
 

STREET MATERIALS 
Bid #2-13 

       
Item (Number Description, Quantity) RCA Asphalt Dakota Supply 

   F.O.B. Delivered F.O.B Delivered
 Crushed Stone 3/4"  $40.00  No Bid No Bid No Bid 
304.03 Graded Processed Stone Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
304.6 Sub-base NYS Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.50  
610.1403 Top Soil Cu Yd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
403.13 Binder Course Type 3 (3.5%) CuYd $80.00/$91.25* N/A No Bid N/A 
403.14 Binder Course Type 4 (4.0%) Cu Yd No Bid N/A No Bid N/A 
403.15 Shim Course Type 5 (8.25%) Cu Yd $100.00/$111.25* N/A No Bid N/A 
403.17 Top Course Type 6F (6.4%) Cu Yd $85.00/$96.25 N/A No Bid N/A 
403.19 Top Course Type 7F (7.0%) Cu Yd $90.00/$010.25* N/A No Bid N/A 
714.06 Asphaltic Concrete Curb Mix (7.5%) Cu Yd $100.00/$111.25* N/A No Bid N/A 
502.2 Class "A" Concrete Cu Yd N/A No Bid N/A $145.50  
8502.95 Controlled Density Fill ("K-Krete") Cu Yd N/A No Bid N/A $115.00  
       

Name of Bidder 
Item (Number Description, Quantity) Peckham Materials Putnam Materials 

   F.O.B. Delivered F.O.B. Delivered
 Crushed Stone 3/4"  No Bid No Bid No Bid 26.50 
304.03 Graded Processed Stone Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.00  
304.6 Sub-base NYS Ton $7.00  $15.50  No Bid No Bid 
610.1403 Top Soil Cu Yd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
403.13 Binder Course Type 3 (3.5%) Cu Yd $78.00/$82.32* N/A No Bid No Bid 
403.14 Binder Course Type 4 (4.0%) Cu Yd $78.00/$82.32* N/A No Bid No Bid 
403.15 Shim Course Type 5 (8.25%) Cu Yd $85.00/$89.32* N/A No Bid No Bid 
403.17 Top Course Type 6F (6.4%) Cu Yd $78.00/$82.32* N/A No Bid No Bid 
403.19 Top Course Type 7F (7.0%) Cu Yd $85.00/$59.32* N/A No Bid No Bid 
714.06 Asphaltic Concrete Curb Mix (7.5%) Cu Yd $87.00/$91.32* N/A No Bid No Bid 
502.2 Class "A" Concrete Cu Yd N/A No Bid N/A No Bid 
8502.95 Controlled Density Fill ("K-Krete") Cu Yd N/A No Bid N/A No Bid 
       

Name of Bidder 
Item (Number Description, Quantity) Bittig & Sons, Inc. Byram Concrete 

   F.O.B. Delivered F.O.B. Delivered
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 Crushed Stone 3/4"  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
304.03 Graded Processed Stone Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
304.6 Sub-base NYS Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
610.1403 Top Soil Cu Yd $19.72  No Bid No Bid No Bid 
403.13 Binder Course Type 3 (3.5%) Cu Yd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
403.14 Binder Course Type 4 (4.0%) Cu Yd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
403.15 Shim Course Type 5 (8.25%) Cu Yd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
403.17 Top Course Type 6F (6.4%) Cu Yd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
403.19 Top Course Type 7F (7.0%) Cu Yd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
714.06 Asphaltic Concrete Curb Mix (7.5%) Cu Yd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
502.2 Class "A" Concrete Cu Yd N/A No Bid N/A $121.00  
8502.95 Controlled Density Fill ("K-Krete") Cu Yd N/A No Bid N/A $85.00  
       
       
*Mileage adjustment as per bid specifications      

 
 
 12. Bid Award for the Police contract for uniforms (Contract #3-13) 
 Roll Call 
 
 Councilman Jovanovich made a motion, seconded by Mayor French, to adopt the 
following Resolution: 
 

RESOLVED, that Bid Contract #3-13 for 
Police Uniforms is hereby awarded to New England 
Sportswear, Inc., the lowest bidder whose bid meets 
specifications. 

 
 
ROLL CALL: 
AYES: Mayor French, Councilmembers Brett, Filippi, Jovanovich, Killian 

and Parker  
NAYS:  Councilman Sack 
ABSENT:  None 
 
The Resolution was adopted by a 6-1 vote 
 

CONTRACT 2013-3 
POLICE  UNIFORMS 

NAME OF BIDDER 
 

New England 
Sportswear 

New England 
Uniform LLC 

ISSUE  ITEM PRICE PRICE 
Blauer Style #8561P7 Trousers, color navy, braid navy $ 74.50 $79.00
Blauer Style 8810 (Men’s) – BDU pants $ 60.00 $60.00
Blauer Style 8810W (Women’s) – BDU pants $ 42.50 $60.00
Long Sleeve Shirt, Blauer, French Blue Heather - Style #8900 $ 42.50 $48.00
Short Sleeve Shirt, Blauer, French Blue Heather - Style #8910 $ 42.50 $46.00
Long Sleeve Shirt, Blauer, French Blue Heather (Women's) - $ 37.50 $48.00



APPROVED MINUTES - Regular Meeting - City Council 
March 20, 2013 - Page 8 

#8900W 
Short Sleeve Shirt, Blauer, French Blue Heather (Women's) - 
#8910W 

$ 37.50 $46.00

Long Sleeve Shirt, Blauer, White – Style #8900 $ 45.50 $48.00
Short Sleeve Shirt, Blauer, White - Style #8910 $ 42.50 $46.00
Black Turtlenecks, Elbeco #7702 with RPD Monogram $ 24.50 $25.00
V-Neck Commando Sweater, Blauer #200 – Black $ 58.00 $68.00
V-Neck Commando Sweater, Blauer #210XCR - Black, 
With Windstopper Liner 

$120.00 $124.00

Cruiser Jacket, Blauer #9010Z $225.00 $225.00
Lightweight Bomber Jacket, Blauer, Black & Yellow $125.00 $129.00
Raincoat & Raincap, Newport Harbor Style #02230 with 
stencil 

$160.00 $160.00

Cap - Sentry #C1001 (Winter or Summer) $ 35.00 $35.00
Tie, 2 ¼” x ¼”, 100% wool knit, NYSPD Style with choke 
proof metal clip 

$   5.00 $9.00

Cool Mesh T-Shirts – Color White $ 20.00 $25.00
Gortex Trooper Style Winter Hat, Blauer #9111 $ 15.00 $30.00
Point Blank Body Armor – Model BIIA; Lev IIA – Male $600.00 $699.00
Point Blank Body Armor – Model BIIA; Lev IIA - Female $600.00 $699.00
Point Blank Vision Ballistic Vest Cover $80.00 $75.00
Uniform Dress Blouse/Formal Blouse as per specifications on 
page 3 of bid proposal 

$235.00 $260.00

White Dress Gloves $   2.00 $4.00
Olympic New York Zip Sleeve Jacket - #ONY673 – Color 
Royal Blue 

$200.00 $260.00

Olympic Cycling Pants - #OCP588 – Color Black $100.00 $105.00
Olympic Cycling Pants with Liner - #OCP588 – Color Black $120.00 $124.00
Olympic Ultraflex Shorts - #ULT189 – Color Black $  80.00 $86.00
Sam Browne Shoulder Strap $  35.00 $36.00
Sam Browne Gun Belt $  50.00 $65.00
Safariland SSIII Holster $100.00 $145.00
Safariland Magazine Pouch – Double $  25.00 $40.00
Safariland Handcuff Case $  20.00 $30.00
Safariland Night Stick Holder $    5.00 $18.00
Safariland Keepers $    4.00 $4.00
Safariland Key Ring $   5.00 $9.00
Safariland Mace Holder $  24.00 $26.00
Safariland Nylon Gun Belt $  45.00 $40.00
Safariland Nylon Holster $125.00 $140.00
Safariland Nylon Cuff Case $  15.00 $30.00
Safariland Nylon Magazine Pouch – Double $  25.00 $30.00
Safariland Nylon Handcuff Case $  25.00 -
Safariland Nylon Keepers $   3.00 $4.00
Bianchi Nylon OC Spray Holder $  18.00 $23.00
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Bianchi Nylon Expandable Baton Holder $  10.00 $22.00
Bianchi Nylon Key Holder $  10.00 $9.00
Collar Insignia, Silver R.P.D., 2 pair per officer, 3/8” shirt, ½” 
outer garment 

$  10.00 $14.00

Collar Insignia, Gold, D.E.T., 1 Pair per Detective, 3/8" Shirt $  10.00 $15.00
Collar Insignia, Gold, R.P.D., ½" outer garment (2 Pair per 
Lt/Sgt/Det) 

$  10.00 $14.00

Collar Insignia, Gold Rank for Shirts (2 Pair per Lt/Sgt) $  10.00 $10.00
Personalized Name Plates:  
             Gold $  8.00 $12.00
             Silver $  8.00 $12.00
Sgt. Chevrons on Shirts and Outer Garments where Required $   5.00 $6.00
Hash Marks - All Officers as Required, Priced per Mark  
             Blue/White on Black - P.O./Sgt $   2.00 $3.00
             Gold/White for Lieuts., Shirts $   2.00 $3.00
             Gold/Black for Lieuts., Outer Garments $   2.00 $3.00
Tailoring Cost per Garment for Chevrons/Hashmarks n/c n/c

 
THE FOLLOWING ITEMS MAY BE SUBSTITUTED AT THE PURCHASER’S SOLE 
DISCRETION: 
 

Conqueror: style T1775DN (ECO) Men’s Cargo Pocket 
Trousers 

$52.50 $55.00

Conqueror: style F1775DN (ECO) Women’s Cargo Pocket 
Trousers 

$52.50 $55.00

Long Sleeve Shirt, Conqueror, French Blue – Style #1525FB 
(ECO) 

$48.00 $48.00

Long Sleeve Shirt, Conqueror, French Blue (Women’s) – Style 
#L1525FB (ECO) 

$48.00 $48.00

Short Sleeve Shirt, Conqueror, French Blue:  Style #1825FB 
(ECO) 

$44.00 $45.00

Short Sleeve Shirt, Conqueror, French Blue (Women’s): Style 
#L1825FB (ECO) 

$44.00 $45.00

 
TRAINING UNIFORM (Embroidery – name & shield on the front, City of Rye Police on 
Back) 
 

Guildan Short Sleeve Polo (Navy) $35.00 $39.00
Game 8070 Work Sweatshirt $60.00 $65.00
Propper 5335 BDU (Ripstop) Trouser Tan $35.00 $40.00

 
 
 
 
13. Miscellaneous Communications and Reports 
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 Councilwoman Parker reported that she had attended a County Board of Legislators 
Government Operations Committee meeting where Playland was discussed.  The ice casino will 
not be operational by September 15th, and the boardwalk will not be ready by opening day in 
May. It appears that it was known for some time that these deadlines would not be met. Ms. 
Parker will attend the next meeting of this Committee. Councilman Filippi suggested that the 
Council should draft a Resolution to the County regarding the delay and City Manager Pickup 
was asked to contact the County Parks Department.  Dierdre Curran spoke against the 
Sustainable Playland option for the operation of Playland that had been endorsed by the Council.  
She said she felt that this was not the best option for the operation of Playland and that it would 
result in the loss of the amusement park.   
 
 Councilwoman Brett announced that the Rye Community Synagogue will hole a 
community conversation on “Civility in the City of Rye” on April 3rd from 7:00 to 8:30 p.m. 
 
 Corporation Counsel Wilson went to the last meeting of the Board of Architectural 
Review to discuss their proposed recommendations and will present a draft law at their next 
meeting. 
 
 Mayor French said that the Recreation Commission is concerned with the maintenance of 
playing fields and are looking for money from the Capital Improvement Plan to help restore 
existing fields.  The Cable and Communications Committee is looking to build a 
communications list to network out to other user groups that can communicate for the City in 
emergency situations. 
 
 Councilwoman Parker announced that Larchmont is considering adopting a plastic bag 
ban. 
 
14. Old Business 
 
 There was nothing discussed under this agenda item. 
 
15. New Business 
 
 There was nothing discussed under this agenda item. 
 
16. Adjournment 
 
 There being no further business to discuss Councilwoman Parker made a motion, 
seconded by Councilwoman Brett and unanimously carried, to adjourn the meeting at 12:19 a.m. 
 
         Respectfully submitted, 
 
 
 
         Dawn F. Nodarse 
         City Clerk 
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