
CITY OF RYE 
 

NOTICE 
 
 There will be a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Rye on Wednesday, March 
28, 2012, at 8:00 p.m. in the Council Room of City Hall. The Council will convene at 7:30 p.m. and 
it is expected they will adjourn into Executive Session at 7:31 p.m. to discuss real estate matters.   
 
 

 
AGENDA 

 
1. Pledge of Allegiance. 
 
2. Roll Call. 
 
3. General Announcements. 
 
4. Draft unapproved minutes of the regular meeting of the City Council held March 14, 2012.   
 
5. Bid Award for the Bowman Avenue Sluice Gate Project (Contract #2012-01). 
            Roll Call.  
 
6. Authorization for the City Manager to enter into an agreement with WSP Sells for the 

Bowman Avenue Upper Dam Resizing Flood Control Project. 
            Roll Call.  
 
7. Mayor’s Management Report    
             ●  Update from the Recreation Commission 
             ●  Update from the Sustainability Committee on energy saving projects: Biofuels, Energy  
                 Audit, the Plastic Bag Ban implementation and the April 23rd No-Idling Day. 
             ●  Legal Update 
 
8. Presentation by Commissioner William R. Connors on the proposed revision of the Rules and 

Regulations of the City of Rye Police Department: General Order# 121.04.   
 
9. Discussion of the position of City Engineer and Public Works Superintendent and the 

upgrade of an existing staff position to Assistant Civil Engineer.  
 
10. Resolution to transfer funds from the Contingency account and the Building and Vehicles 

fund, to fund the position of City Engineer/Public Works Superintendent and Assistant Civil 
Engineer.  

            Roll Call. 
 
11. Consideration of a request by the Rye Little League to approve a parade to kickoff Opening 

Day of the 55th Little League Season on Saturday, April 21, 2012 beginning at 12:00 p.m.    
 



12. Consideration of a request by the Midland Elementary School PTO to approve a parade to 
precede the Midland Elementary School Fair on Saturday, April 28, 2012 from 9:00 a.m. to 
10:15 a.m.    

 
13. Consideration of a request by the Rye YMCA for the use of City streets for the 24th Annual 

Rye Derby on Sunday, April 29, 2012 from 9:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m.  
 
14. Consideration of a request by the Cystic Fibrosis Foundation for the use of City streets for the 

24th Annual Great Strides Walk on Sunday, May 20, 2012 from 9:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m.  
 
15. Residents may be heard on matters for Council consideration that do not appear on the agenda. 
 
16. Miscellaneous communications and reports. 
 
17. Old Business. 
 
18. New Business. 
 
19. Adjournment. 
 

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 
 

      The next regular meeting of the City Council will be held on Wednesday, April 4, 2012 at 8:00 p.m.  
 

** City Council meetings are available live on Cablevision Channel 75, Verizon Channel 39, and  
     on the City Website, indexed by Agenda item, at www.ryeny.gov under “RyeTV Live”. 
 
  * Office Hours of the Mayor available by appointment this week.    

http://www.ryeny.gov/


 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

NO.  4 DEPT.:  City Clerk DATE: March 28, 2012  

 CONTACT:  Dawn F. Nodarse 
AGENDA ITEM Draft unapproved minutes of the Regular 
Meeting of the City Council held March 14, 2012, as 
attached. 
 

 FOR THE MEETING OF:   
 March 28, 2012 

RYE CITY CODE, 
 CHAPTER        
 SECTION       

 

 

 

RECOMMENDATION:  That the Council approve the draft minutes. 

 

IMPACT:     Environmental    Fiscal    Neighborhood    Other: 

 

 

 

BACKGROUND:   
Approve the minutes of the Regular Meeting of the City Council held March 14, 2012, as 
attached. 
 
    
 
 

 



DRAFT UNAPPROVED MINUTES of the 
Regular Meeting of the City Council of the City of 
Rye held in City Hall on March 14, 2012 at 8:00 P.M. 

 
PRESENT: 
 DOUGLAS FRENCH Mayor 
 LAURA BRETT 
 RICHARD FILIPPI 
 PETER JOVANOVICH  
 SUZANNA KEITH 
 CATHERINE F. PARKER 
 JOSEPH A. SACK 
 Councilmembers 
 
ABSENT: None 
 
 

The Council convened at 7:35 p.m.  Councilwoman Keith made a motion, seconded by 
Councilman Filippi and unanimously carried to immediately adjourn into executive session to 
discuss real estate matters. Councilman Jovanovich made a motion, seconded by Councilwoman 
Brett and unanimously carried to adjourn the executive session at 8:05 p.m.  The regular session 
began at 8:14 p.m. 
 
1. Pledge of Allegiance 
 
 Mayor French called the meeting to order and invited the Council to join in the Pledge of 
Allegiance. 
 
 
2. Roll Call 
 
 Mayor French asked the City Clerk to call the roll; a quorum was present to conduct 
official city business. 
 
 
3. General Announcements 
 
 Announcements were made regarding various upcoming meetings and events. 
 
 
4. Draft unapproved minutes of the regular meeting of the City Council held February 29, 2012  
 
 Councilman Jovanovich made a motion, seconded by Councilman Filippi and 
unanimously carried, to approve the minutes of the regular meeting of the City Council held on 
February 29, 2012, as submitted. 
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5. Mayor’s Management Report   
             ●  Legal Update    
 
 Corporation Counsel Wilson reported on the following issues: 

 2 Central Avenue – The asbestos removal on the property will begin on March 16th.  A 
Nixle alert will be sent out to residents within a quarter mile radius. 

 McKeever v. City of Rye – A trial in this matter, that concerns a tree that fell on 
someone’s property, was held in Rye City Court.  The City argued that it was not on 
notice that the tree was in danger of falling. The Judge reserved decision. 

 People v. Schwartz – The Court of Appeals dismissed the defendant’s appeal for failure 
to prosecute. 

 Molloy v. City of Rye –A matter is still pending in City Court. Petitioner’s time to appeal 
in the Article 78 proceeding has expired.   The City is working with the applicant to 
resolve the outstanding matter. 

 
6. Review of the Forest Avenue Safe Streets Project  
 
 City Manager Pickup said the City is working on the implementation aspects of putting 
“sharrows” on Forest Avenue this year.  City Planner Christian Miller and Assistant City 
Engineer Christopher Tallarini made a presentation on the project.  Mr. Miller said there have 
been many Council discussions about enhancements to Forest Avenue and the June 2011 report 
by the Shared Roadways Committee identified possible enhancement, which include striping a 
ten foot to 12 foot travel lane in each direction and installing sharrows, which are shared lane 
markings that delineate that bikes share the roadway with vehicles.  A benefit to the project is 
that the money is coming from a grant from the YMCA.  The project will include the entire 
length of Forest Avenue with sharrows going in both directions.  There will be a white line on 
the side of the road to delineate the width of the lane.  A section of Forest Avenue from Cornel 
Place to Green Avenue is already scheduled to be paved this Summer; therefore, the sharrows 
will not be implemented until after the paving is complete.  The spacing of the sharrows is every 
200 to 250 feet as required by the New York State Uniform Traffic Control Device Manual, so 
there will be about 60 in each direction.  There could also be some enhancements to existing 
crosswalks on Forest Avenue at Hewlett Avenue such as painting or additional signage, 
depending on availability of funding.  City Manager Pickup said that individual notifications will 
not be made to residents, but information will be put on the website and the citizen committees 
could also be asked do some outreach to residents. 
 
 Jim Amico expressed concerns about enforcement with more pedestrian traffic and John 
Carey spoke about joggers and walkers being educated to walk against traffic and not with it. 
 
 
7. Presentation by the EAGR Committee on proposed changes to the City of Rye Tree Ordinance 

Legislation  
 
 Mayor French said that it is the will of the Council that the City’s Tree Ordinance should 
be changed, but the issue of how any changes will be accomplished relative to permitting and 
enforcement is critical. 
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 Melissa Grieco of the Environmental Advocacy Group of Rye (EAGR) said the main 
intent behind the proposed changes to the tree ordinance was to curtail clear cutting of trees 
mostly on lots being prepared for construction projects.  She made a presentation that: outlined 
the efforts of EAGR to date in connection with the issue; summarized the benefits of trees to the 
community; put forth reasons to pass a new tree ordinance; showed before and after photographs 
of tree removal in Rye; provided a snapshot of tree ordinances adopted by other communities; 
compared the proposed changes with what is currently in effect; and outlined the work of a 
proposed Tree Committee, which has been added to the draft law to offset the workload of staff. 
 
 City Manager Pickup said that extending the law to cover city-owned properties would 
impact projects especially those at the Nature Center.  He also said that the City would have a 
problem with addressing challenges to the law by homeowners whose properties are impacted.  
City Planner Miller said that the creation of a Discretionary Review Board would make the 
process of obtaining a tree removal permit a more cumbersome and lengthy process and 
suggested that a staff administered process would be more efficient, with the possible assistance 
of a certified arborist, the cost of which would be born by the applicant. He also said that the 
mitigation aspect of the proposed law would create an additional burden to administrate because 
someone must make sure the mitigation takes place and that the trees planted survive for at least 
two years. He suggested making smaller changes to the law and then coming back in a couple of 
years to reevaluate the law.  He also suggested that instead of creating a new board, established 
boards that currently look at land use applications such as the Board of Architectural Review 
(BAR) could take on some of this work. A suggestion was made that Mr. Miller provide a step-
by-step plan that he thinks would be more beneficial.  It was also suggested that the procedures 
could be changed to make it easier for a homeowner to remove a diseased, dangerous or invasive 
tree.  
 
 Members of the public commenting included Carolyn Cunningham, Bill Lawyer, Linda 
and Irwin Lefkowitz, Robin Jovanovich and Joseph Latwin.  There comments included: 
 

 It is important that the City be subject to the requirements of the law. 
 By changing the law to include all trees on a property over 8” DBH (Diameter Breast 

Height) the issue of clear cutting is addressed. 
 How much will it cost a homeowner to take down a diseased tree? 
 The BAR would welcome a role in the tree ordinance. 
 Why can’t a resident do what he wants with the trees in his own backyard? 
 Trees don’t have constitutional rights, people do.  Consider if this law will restrict 

people’s freedom over their property. 
 The new proposal will provide an incentive for people to take down trees smaller than the 

size required for a permit. 
 

Revised language will come back to the Council in order for a public hearing to be set for 
the second meeting in April. 
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8. Discussion of a proposed change to Local Law Chapter 90 “Fences and Walls” to further define 
the “Division Line, Front” on corner lots  

 
 Corporation Counsel Wilson said that the proposed change to the fence law, which is an 
amendment to the definition of “Division Line, Front” stems from a litigated matter.  Leo Napier, 
Esq. of the firm Friedman Harfenist Kraut & Perlstein, who represented the homeowners in the 
subject litigation, said the proposed law change is based on a the unique situation of a few 
properties along the Boston Post Road because the current regulations deem properties with 
corner lots to have two front yards, and therefore, does not allowed them to maintain a six foot 
fence along the Boston Post Road.  The proposed law would deem the subject corner lot 
properties to only have one front yard. 
 
 Mayor French made a motion, seconded by Councilwoman Keith and unanimously 
carried, to adopt the following Resolution: 
 
 

WHEREAS, the Council wishes to amend Chapter 90 “Fences and 
Walls” of the Code of the City of Rye to further define the “Division Line, 
Front” on corner lots; and 

 
WHEREAS, it is now desired to call a public hearing on such 

proposed amendments to the law, now, therefore, be it 
 
RESOLVED, by the Council of the City of Rye as follows: 
 

 Section 1. Pursuant to Section 20 of the Municipal Home Rule 
Law and the Charter of the City of Rye, New York, a public hearing will 
be held by the Council of said City on April 4, 2012 at 8:00 P.M. at City 
Hall, Boston Post Road, in said City, for the purpose of affording 
interested persons an opportunity to be heard concerning such proposed 
local law. 

 
Section 2.  Such notice of public hearing shall be in substantially 

the following form: 
 

PUBLIC NOTICE 

CITY OF RYE 
 

Notice of Public Hearing on a proposed local law to amend Chapter 
90 “Fences and Walls” of the City Code of the City of Rye to further 
define “Division Line, Front” on corner lots. 

 
Notice is hereby given that a public hearing will be held by the City 
Council of the City of Rye on the 4th day of April, 2012 at 8:00 P.M. at 
City Hall, Boston Post Road, in said City, at which interested persons will 
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be afforded an opportunity to be heard concerning a proposal to amend 
Chapter 90 “Fences and Walls” of the City Code of the City of Rye to 
further define “Division Line, Front” on corner lots. 

 
Copies of said local law may be obtained from the office of the City Clerk. 
              
Dawn F. Nodarse 
City Clerk 
Dated:  March 26, 2012 

 
 
9. Authorization for the City Manager to enter into an agreement with FPM Group, Ltd. to perform 

hydrology and environmental engineering services regarding the impact on flood storage analysis 
at the Project Home Run site   

            Roll Call. 
 
 This agenda item was deferred 
 
 
10. Resolution to transfer funds from the Contingency account and the Building and Vehicles 

fund, to fund the position of City Engineer/Public Works Superintendent and upgrade the 
existing staff position to Assistant Civil Engineer  

            Roll Call. 
 
 City Manager Pickup said that with the list of capital projects getting more complex there 
is a need for on-staff professional engineering in order to complete projects.  The Council asked 
to have this item deferred in order for staff to provide additional information regarding the long 
term costs associated with the position, where the money would come from and why the position 
was not anticipated in the 2012 budget. 

  
 
11. Consideration of a request by the Milton Elementary School PTO to approve a parade to 

precede the Milton Elementary School Fair on Saturday, March 31, 2012 from 9:00 a.m. 
to 10:15 a.m.    

 
 Councilwoman Brett made a motion, seconded by Councilman Filippi and unanimously 
carried, to adopt the following Resolution: 
 

RESOLVED, that the request made by the 
Milton Elementary School PTO to approve a parade 
to precede the Milton Elementary School Fair on 
Saturday, March 31, 2012 from 9:00 a.m. to 10:15 
a.m., is hereby approved. 
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12. Residents may be heard on matters for Council consideration that do not appear on the agenda 
 
 
 Jim Amico, 350 Midland Avenue said that the City does not need a County permit to 
install a stop sign on Midland Avenue, a County-owned road.    He said County Legislator Judy 
Myers had contacted a lawyer for the County Legislature to investigate the situation. He 
presented documents he had obtained as proof. Councilwoman Parker said that she had 
confirmed with Congresswoman Nita Lowey’s office that the City must wait until the stimulus 
funds are received to go ahead with a stop sign test at Midland Avenue and Palisade Road.  The 
City Manager and Corporation Counsel were asked to follow up with the County on the City’s 
permit application and also to determine what the recourse would be if the permit is denied. 
 
 Anthony Piscionere, Boston Post Road, spoke about the most recent referral to the Board 
of Ethics concerning allegations made by a staff member.  He said he did not believe the Board 
of Ethics was the appropriate venue for the investigation.  He said that according to the City 
Code, the City Council, not the Board of Ethics, has the authority to conduct an investigation. He 
suggested that either the Council conduct an investigation into the claims or hire someone to 
conduct an investigation. A proper investigation would allow for confidence in the outcome. 
Mayor French said that the allegations were an employee matter and were being dealt with by the 
City’s labor counsel and the complainant had asked that it be referred to the Board of Ethics.  
Mr. Piscionere said that if the Council wants the Board of Ethics to conduct investigations, the 
law should be changed to grant them that power. 
 
 There was a lengthy discussion among the Council regarding Mr. Piscionere’s 
suggestions.  A variety of opinions were stated by members of the Council including: a Council-
led investigation is necessary; most people in the community do not care about the issues; it is 
more important to spend money on capital projects than outside attorneys’ fees for an 
investigation; the Board of Ethics can review the issue and make recommendations to the City 
Council which can then be acted upon; since the allegations involve employee misconduct they 
should be treated confidentially; the Council is trying to find the best way to handle the issue; the 
complaint raised an ethical issue, and, therefore, was referred to the Board of Ethics for an 
advisory opinion; and the City needs legal advise on how to handle the employment aspect of the 
case in order to deal with liability issues.  A suggestion was made that since this discussion 
involves a specific employee matter it should be continued in Executive Session and discussed 
confidentially. 
 
 Sis D’Angelo, Wappanocca Avenue, said the people in Rye are upset and don’t believe 
what the Council says.  She said it was the duty of the Council to “heal the City.” 
 
 Ray Tartaglione, 600 Andersonhill Road, Purchase spoke about a shift in code 
enforcement by the City and read a statement relating to recent charges brought against Mayor 
French in connection with property he owns on Richard Place.  Mayor French said that he 
disagreed with everything that Mr. Tartaglione said and noted that he has been absolved of all 
the allegations brought against him. 
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13. Bid Award for Street Materials (Bid #1-12) 
            Roll Call.  
 
 Councilwoman Keith made a motion, seconded by Councilman Filippi, to adopt the 
following Resolution: 
 

      
 RESOLVED, that Bid #1-12, Street 
Materials, is hereby awarded to Putnam Materials 
for crushed stone ¾ (Delivered) and graded 
processed stone; to Canal Asphalt for crushed stone 
¾ (F.O.B.); to Peckham Materials for sub-base 
(recycled concrete); binder course Types 3 and 4, 
shim course Type 5, top course Types 6F and 7F, 
and asphaltic concrete curb mix, to Byram Concrete 
LLC for Class for Class A Concrete and Dakota 
Supply for K-Krete, as the bidders offering the 
lowest price. 

 
ROLL CALL: 
AYES: Mayor French, Councilmembers Brett, Filippi, Jovanovich, Keith, 

Parker and Sack 
NAYS:  None 
ABSENT:  None 
 
The Resolution was adopted by a 7-0 vote. 
 
See bid tab on following page. 
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NAME OF BIDDER RCA Asphalt Dakota Supply Peckham Materials 

# Items PER TON PER TON PER TON 

  F.O.B. Delivered F.O.B. Delivered F.O.B. Delivered 

 Crushed Stone 3/4" 37.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

  Graded Processed Stone NYS 304.03 N/B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 Sub-base NYS 304.6 N/B No Bid No Bid 20.50  No Bid 15.50 

  PER C.Y. PER C.Y. PER C.Y. 

# Items F.O.B. Delivered F.O.B. Delivered F.O.B. Delivered 

403.13 Binder Course Type 3  (3.5%) 80.00/91.25* N/A No Bid N/A 78.00/82.32* N/A 

403.14 Binder Course Type 4  (4.0%) No Bid N/A No Bid N/A 78.00/82.32* N/A 

403.15 Shim Course Type 5   (8.25%) 100.00/111.25* N/A No Bid N/A 85.00/89.32* N/A 

403.17 Top Course Type 6F  (6.4%) 85.00/96.25* N/A No Bid N/A 78.00/82.32* N/A 

403.19 Top Course type 7F  (7.0%) 90.00/101.25* N/A No Bid N/A 85.00/89.32* N/A 

714.06 Asphaltic Concrete Curb Mix   (7.5%) 100.00/111.25* N/A No Bid N/A 87.00/91.32* N/A 

# Items PER C.Y. PER C.Y. PER C.Y. 

502.2 Class "A" Concrete N/A No Bid N/A 134.50 N/A No Bid 

8503 Controlled backfill ("K-Krete") N/A No Bid N/A 90.50 N/A No Bid 

        

*Mileage adjustment as per bid specifications      

 
NAME OF BIDDER Putnam Materials Canal Asphalt Byram Concrete 

# Items PER TON PER TON PER TON 

  F.O.B. Delivered F.O.B. Delivered F.O.B. Delivered 

 Crushed Stone 3/4" No Bid 26.75 30.8 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

  Graded Processed Stone NYS 304.03 No Bid 21.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 Sub-base NYS 304.6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

  PER C.Y. PER C.Y. PER C.Y. 

# Items F.O.B. Delivered F.O.B. Delivered No Bid No Bid 

403.13 Binder Course Type 3  (3.5%) No Bid No Bid 77.00/91.15* No Bid No Bid No Bid 

403.14 Binder Course Type 4  (4.0%) No Bid No Bid 77.00/91.15* No Bid No Bid No Bid 

403.15 Shim Course Type 5   (8.25%) No Bid No Bid 95.00/109.15* No Bid No Bid No Bid 

403.17 Top Course Type 6F  (6.4%) No Bid No Bid 82.00/96.15* No Bid No Bid No Bid 

403.19 Top Course type 7F  (7.0%) No Bid No Bid 85.00/99.15* No Bid No Bid No Bid 

714.06 Asphaltic Concrete Curb Mix   (7.5%) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

# Items PER C.Y. PER C.Y. PER C.Y. 

502.2 Class "A" Concrete N/A No Bid N/A No Bid N/A 126.00 

8503 Controlled backfill ("K-Krete") N/A No Bid N/A No Bid N/A 92.00 
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14. Resolution to authorize expenditure of police donation funds for the purchase of police boots or 

shoes  
            Roll Call. 
 
 Councilwoman Keith made a motion, seconded by Councilman Filippi, to adopt the 
following Resolution: 
 

 WHEREAS, the City Manager and Police Commissioner have approved a 
request of the Rye Police Association (“RPA”) dated February 27, 2012 to 
purchase dress boots/shoes in the amount of $3,500 for the Rye Police 
Department with funds available in the police donations account, and, 

 
 WHEREAS, sufficient funds exist in the police donations account to comply with 

the aforementioned request of the RPA; now therefore be it, 
 
 RESOLVED, that the City Comptroller is authorized to transfer $2,106.83 from 

the police donations account to increase 2012 General Fund appropriations for 
Police uniforms. 

 
ROLL CALL: 
AYES: Mayor French, Councilmembers Brett, Filippi, Jovanovich, Keith, 

Parker and Sack 
NAYS:  None 
ABSENT:  None 
 
The Resolution was adopted by a 7-0 vote 
 
 
15. Consideration of proposed revision of the Rules and Regulations of the City of Rye Police 

Department: General Order# 121.04 
 
 Mayor French said that before voting on this issue, the Council would like to have a 
presentation by the Police Commissioner and the Cable Committee.  
 
 
16. Miscellaneous Communications and Reports 
 
 Councilwoman Parker said that Bob Clyatt and Helen Gates had presented the proposal 
for a sculpture exhibit on Purchase Street to the Chamber of Commerce.  Sally Wright of the 
Chamber will walk with Mr. Clyatt, City Manager Pickup and herself to see where the sculptures 
will be placed.  The owners of the businesses where sculptures will be placed will be asked to 
sign off on the locations.  Ms. Parker also asked why the lockdown at the schools earlier in the 
week was lifted before the person the police were looking for was still in Rye. 
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17. Old Business 
 
 Councilman Filippi asked if the City’s contractor could be asked to come back to fix the 
cracked sidewalks on Osborn Road earlier than normal due to the mild weather. 
 
 Councilwoman Parker said that she and Councilman Jovanovich were supposed to meet 
with Deputy County Executive Kevin Plunkett regarding the issue of the #76 bus route to see if 
the County had asked Liberty Lines for a cost estimate for restoring service to Milton Point, but 
the meeting was cancelled and has not yet been rescheduled.  Ms. Parker also asked for an 
update on liens on properties with outstanding property taxes. 
 
 Councilwoman Brett asked for an update on the Sluice Gate project.  City Manager 
Pickup said that the specs are out to bid and a pre-bid meeting was held with over 20 contractors.  
He added that a minor modification will be issued to the bid specs based on questions from the 
contractors and the bids are due back next week. 
 
18. New Business 
 
 Mayor French asked when the Council would receive a financial update on the end of 
2011.  City Manager Pickup said that staff will work on it. 
 
19. Adjournment 
 
 There being no further business to discuss Councilwoman Keith made a motion, 
seconded by Councilman Filippi and unanimously carried, to adjourn the regular meeting at 
11:07 p.m. 
 
 Councilwoman Brett made a motion, seconded by Councilwoman Parker and 
unanimously carried, to adjourn into executive session to discuss a personnel/employment matter 
at 11:07 p.m.  Councilwoman Brett made a motion, seconded by Councilman Filippi and 
unanimously carried, to adjourn the executive session at 11:25 p.m. 
 
         Respectfully submitted, 
 
 
 
         Dawn F. Nodarse 
         City Clerk 
 
 
 
 
 



 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

 

NO.   5  DEPT.: Engineering                                                          DATE:  March 28, 2012 

                        CONTACT: Christopher Tallarini, Assistant City Engineer, P.E. 
AGENDA ITEM:  Bid Award for the Bowman Avenue 
Sluice Gate Project (Contract # 2012-01). 

 

 FOR THE MEETING OF:   
 March 28, 2012 

 

 
RECOMMENDATION:  That the City Council adopt the following resolution: 
 
    WHEREAS, that the Assistant City Engineer recommends that Contract #2012-01 be awarded 
to the low bidder, ELQ Industries, Inc., in the amount of nine hundred seventy thousand seven 
hundred twenty five dollars and no cents ($970,725.00), from account 585405-52906-85405 and,
 
    WHEREAS, City staff has determined that the following costs will be associated with the 
Bowman Avenue Sluice Gate project for the Engineering firm of WSP Sells: Supplemental 
Agreement of $42,300, Construction Inspection of $50,000, and Construction Support of 
$20,000, totaling $112,300, from account 585405-52902-85405 and, 
 
     WHEREAS, the Accounts 585405-52902-85405 and 585405-52906-85405 have a sufficient 
balance to fund the project, now therefore be it 
 
     RESOLVED, that the City Council award the Bowman Avenue Sluice Gate Project with the 
total cost of $1,083,025.  

 

 

IMPACT:     Environmental  Fiscal  Neighborhood  Other:  

 

BACKGROUND: Twelve bids were received and analyzed. The low bidder, ELQ Industries, 
Inc. meets all the requirements to be the responsible low bidder for the Bowman Avenue Sluice 
Gate Project.  They have done quality work for the City in the past.  Please see the attached 
memo and bid results for more information and the overall project cost. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 





Position Contractor Contractor's Bid Engineer's Check
Dollar Amount Above 

Low Bid
% Above 

Low Bidder

1 ELQ Industries $970,725.00 $970,725.00 $0.00 0.00%

2 McNamee Construction $974,000.00 $974,000.00 $3,275.00 0.34%

3 Bilotta Construction $989,556.15 $989,556.15 $18,831.15 1.94%

4 Bradhurst Site Construction $1,084,208.00 $1,084,208.00 $113,483.00 11.69%

5 Legacy Valve LLC $1,120,000.00 $1,120,000.00 $149,275.00 15.38%

6 Arben Group $1,148,000.00 $1,148,000.00 $177,275.00 18.26%

7 R. Pugni and Sons $1,185,875.00 $1,185,875.00 $215,150.00 22.16%

8 Fourmen Construction $1,208,497.00 $1,208,486.50 $237,761.50 24.49%

9 Rock Island Contractors Inc. $1,238,404.00 $1,238,404.00 $264,404.00 27.24%

10 Eventus Construction Co. Inc. $1,295,806.00 $1,295,806.00 $306,249.85 31.55%

11 Landi Contracting Inc. $1,450,000.00 $1,450,100.00 $365,892.00 37.69%

12 MVM Construction $1,485,000.00 $1,485,000.00 $365,000.00 37.60%

Contract No. 2012-01 - Bowman Avenue Dam Sluice Gate Project



 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

NO.    6 DEPT.: City Manager  DATE: March 28, 2012 

 CONTACT:  Scott Pickup, City Manager 
ACTION: Authorization for the City Manager to enter into 
an agreement with WSP Sells for the Bowman Avenue 
Upper Dam Resizing Flood Control Project. 
 
 

 FOR THE MEETING OF:   
 March 28, 2012 

RYE CITY CODE, 
 N/A 

 

 

 
RECOMMENDATION:   That the City Council authorize the City Manager to enter into the 
agreement with the engineering firm of WSP Sells for the Bowman Avenue Upper Dam 
Resizing Flood Control Project for the amount of one hundred and eight thousand six hundred 
dollars and no cents ($108,600.00), to be funded from account 585405-52902-85405. 
 

 

IMPACT:     Environmental    Fiscal     Neighborhood    Other: 

 

 

 
BACKGROUND:  The objective of this Flood Control project is to study the impact of resizing the 
Bowman Avenue Dam reservoir on Blind Brook discharges and water surface profiles 
downstream of the dam. A proposal from WSP Sells detailing the cost and scope of work is 
attached.  
 
 
 
 

 

















 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

NO.  7 DEPT.:  City Council  DATE: March 28, 2012    

 CONTACT:  Mayor Douglas French  
AGENDA ITEM:  Mayor's Management Report 
 

 FOR THE MEETING OF:   
 March 28, 2012 

RYE CITY CODE, 
 CHAPTER        
 SECTION       

 

 

 

RECOMMENDATION:  That the City Manager provide a report on requested topics. 

 

IMPACT:     Environmental    Fiscal    Neighborhood    Other: 

 

 

 

BACKGROUND:  The Mayor has requested an update from the City Manager on the following: 
        
 
 Update from the Recreation Commission 

 Update from the Sustainability Committee on energy saving topics: Biofuels, the Energy 
Audit, the Plastic Bag Ban implementation, and the April 23rd No-Idling Day 

 Legal Update 
 
              
                   
         

 



Update on Rye Sustainability Committee Activities

March 28, 2012

Presentation to City Council



Summary of RSC Initiatives

Go Green to Save Green



 

Greenhouse Gas Emissions Audit



 

RSC Celebrates Earth Day



 

Potential Biodiesel Initiative 



Greenhouse Gas Emissions Audit

Go Green to Save Green



 

Municipal Inputs: Actual electricity, natural gas, fuel 
oil, gasoline and diesel usage.



 

Community Inputs: Actual electricity and natural gas 
usage and solid waste figures.  Estimated fuel oil, 
kerosene, wood, gasoline and diesel usage.  



 

Emissions results are as per assumptions made with 
guidance from ICLEI.



Summary of Municipal Inputs for  2009
 Electricity and Natural Gas

Electricity 
Usage
(Kwh)

Cost
($)

Gas
Usage

(Therms)

Cost
($)

Buildings & 
Facilities

2,183,387 306,958 100,458 151,173

Streetlights &Traffic 
Signals 

1,199,799 225,115

Pump Stations 113,148 23,711 771 2,194

Vehicle Fleet

TOTAL 3,496,334 $555,784 101,229 $153,367



Go Green to Save Green

Summary of Municipal Inputs for  2009
 Gasoline, Diesel and Fuel Oil

Gasoline 
Usage

(Gallons)

Cost
($)

Diesel
Usage

(Gallons)

Cost
($)

Fuel Oil 
Usage

(Gallons)

Cost 
($)

Buildings & 
Facilities

2,505 $4,420

Streetlights 
&Traffic Signals 

Pump Stations

Vehicle Fleet 48,688 Not 
Provided

39,643 Not 
Provided

TOTAL 48,688 Not 
Provided

39,643 Not 
Provided

2,505 $4,420



Go Green to Save Green

2009 Municipal Emissions Summary by 
Sector

Tons % MMBTUs %
Buildings and Facilities 1,389              50% 17,845                    53%
Vehicle Fleet 926                  34% 11,546                    34%
Streetlights & Traffic Signals 424                  15% 4,095                      12%
Pump Stations 44                    1% 463                          1%

2,783              100% 33,949                    100%

CO2e Energy 



2009 Municipal Emissions Summary by 
Energy Source

Go Green to Save Green

Tons % MMBTUs %
Electricity 1,235              44% 11,933                    35%
Natural Gas 594                  21% 10,123                    30%
Gasoline 483                  17% 6,048                      18%
Diesel 444                  17% 5,498                      16%
Fuel Oil 27                    1% 347                          1%

2,783              100% 33,949                    100%

CO2e Energy 



2009 Total Rye Community Emissions by 
Sector

Go Green to Save Green

Tons % MMBTUs %
Transportation 78,041            37% 975,861                  35%
Residential  72,315            34% 1,026,361              37%
Commercial 58,295            27% 688,642                  25%
Municipal 2,783              1% 33,949                    1%
Waste 1,969              1% 56,255                    2%

213,403         100% 2,781,068              100%

CO2e Energy 



Go Green to Save Green

2009 Total Rye Community Emissions by 
Energy Source

Tons % MMBTUs %
Gasoline 65,826            31% 824,575                  30%
Electricity 57,612            27% 556,708                  20%
Natural Gas 53,763            25% 916,853                  33%
Fuel Oil 20,727            10% 255,601                  9%
Diesel 13,143            6% 162,832                  6%
Waste  1,969              1% 56,255                    2%
Kerosene 328                  0% 4,091                      0%
Wood 35                    0% 4,153                      0%

213,403         100% 2,781,068              100%

CO2e Energy 



Completion of GHG Audit

Go Green to Save Green

What does this mean?


 

Draft GHG Inventory Summary complete, to be 
incorporated into Sustainability Plan


 

Provides a benchmark for long term sustainability 
goals


 

Provides a framework for the Sustainability Plan –
 

set 
goals


 

Establishes Rye as a credible leader in sustainability



RSC Celebrates Earth Day:
 No Idling Day on April 23rd

Go Green to Save Green



 

Over ten schools participating across four 
communities



 

City Council statement declaring April 23rd

 “Soundshore
 

Communities’
 

No-Idling Day”


 

Rye PD awareness initiatives


 

Suggested: new no-idling sign at library parking 
lot



 

In conjunction with walk to school week



RSC Celebrates Earth Day:
 Awareness for May 7th

 
Law

Go Green to Save Green



 

Awareness activities to date:


 

Posters


 

Information packets for merchants


 

5x7 cards


 

Countertop cards


 

Underwriting for all material by Jay Heritage Center



 

To Do:


 

Follow-up for residents’
 

questions/concerns?


 

Media


 

E-blasts: Schools, Rye community e-letter



Potential Grease Recycling 
Initiative

Go Green to Save Green



 

Follow-up from 10/5/11 Presentation


 

Opportunity to obtain ultra low sulfur diesel 
for use in Rye’s municipal diesel fleet



 

Opportunity to promote a community-wide 
recycling campaign 



Next Steps

Go Green to Save Green



 

Continued community awareness initiatives


 

Continue to partner with neighboring communities on 
specific initiatives



 

Completion of sustainability plan 



City Council Declaration of Sound Shore Communities’ No­Idling Day 

As part of “RSC Celebrates Earth Day”, The City of Rye is joining with the Village of 

Larchmont, Town of Mamaroneck, and the Village of Mamaroneck to declare 

Monday, April 23, a day of awareness about the harmful effects of engine idling and 

o encourage our community to take action to reduce unnecessary idling. t

 

We recognize that excessive emissions from idling are harmful to our environment, 

our citizens’ health, and a drain on our wallets. Excessive idling: 

 is against the law, with a fine of $150 for any vehicle idling longer than 3 

minutes; 

 wastes fuel and money; 

 ore than adults; and is hazardous to our health, impacting children m

 affects air quality and pollutes the environment. 

 

The City Council, Rye Police Department, and area schools are united in encouraging 

residents to:  

 turn off their engines when idling for longer than 30 seconds;  

 spread the word to family and friends and encourage others to eliminate 

unnecessary idling; and 

 maintain vehicles to reduce excessive exhaust. 

 



 
ATTACHMENT: IDLING FACTS 

FACT #1:  IDLING WASTES FUEL AND MONEY 

 Idling more than 10 seconds burns more gas than it takes to restart the 

engine.   

 In 2 minutes an idling car consumes approximately the same amount of fuel 

as traveling one mile.   

FACT #2:  IDLING AFFECTS AIR QUALITY AND YOUR HEALTH 

 Exposure to vehicle exhaust increases the risk of cancer, heart, lung disease 

. and asthma and asthma is the most common chronic illness among children

 The EPA has identified idling as a major contributor to particulate material 

emissions and Westchester County is ranked 4th worst for fine particulate 

matter in New York State. 

FACT #3:  IDLING CAN DAMAGE YOUR VEHICLE’S ENGINE 

 Because your engine isn’t working at peak operating temperature, fuel does 

not undergo complete combustion.  This leaves fuel residues that 

contaminate engine oil and make spark plugs dirty. 

 Today’s electronic engines do not need idling to be warmed up before being 

operated. 

FACT #4:  IDLING AFFECTS CHILDREN MORE THAN ADULTS 

 Children are more vulnerable to health problems such as asthma and other 

respiratory illnesses because they breathe faster, inhale more air per pound 

s, and are still growing. of body weight compared to adult

FACT #5:  IDLING IS AGAINST THE LAW 

 Do your part  and turn the car off while parked!  Finally, always remember 

that the best you can do is not to use your car at all, instead to walk or bike 

whenever you can 



We are a new kind of Westchester based 
company - 100% sustainable, 100% green.

Our mission is to become the largest service provider of 
"greasecycling" in Westchester and the Hudson Valley 
region. We aspire to help consumers, businesses and 
municipalities understand and value sustainability.

We recycle used cooking oil from restaurants and other 
establishments that fry food. We collect this waste oil and 
filter it to create recycled vegetable oil. This recycled 
vegetable oil is used as a feed stock to produce biodiesel.

We are a scrappy collection of entrepreneurs 
who desire to do financially well while doing 
social good in the world. 

We are evangelists for sustainable issues.



“Greasecycling” & Biodiesel Production



Why Should The City of Rye “Greasecycle”?

1. Replicates Best Practices of 
Other Sustainable Cities such 
as Chicago, IL

2. Reduces the City’s Carbon 
Footprint

3. Leverages & Educates the 
Business & Residential 
Community

4. Promotes Adherence to 
Recycling and Waste 
Disposal Laws

5. City Cost Savings & 
Environmental Benefits 



Goal 1: Diesel for City of Rye Vehicles



Restaurant Window

Decal Program

Restaurant Window

Decal Program
Designated Grease Drop- 

off Location 
Designated Grease Drop- 

off Location



 

Identify a location 
protected from the 
elements and accessible 
to the public for disposal 
of used cooking oil from:


 

Deep Fried Turkey Oil for 
Holidays



 

Spring and Summer Fish Fry



 

Large Food Festivals



 

Open to Any Resident  

Goal 2: “Greasecycling” Access For Business 
& Residents at No Cost to City

Use Decal Programs to indicate 
program participation levels:



Goal 3: “Greasecycling” Awareness 
& Education at No Cost to City



 

Educational Handouts for:



 

Business: Educate 
establishments on the 
importance of proper grease 
disposal and hood cleaning to 
avoid grease fires



 

Residents: Educate citizens 
on the proper way to dispose 
of kitchen grease to avoid 
clogging home plumbing and 
city sewer systems



 

Students: Possible BioBus 
tour of select Rye schools to 
promote science and 
biodiesel use.



Next Steps

1. We need to identify city diesel needs, type and pricing to 
structure a program that saves the city money.

2. Hudson Biofuels will prepare the communication 
documentation for distribution to Rye establishments.

3. Once the City Council provides the “greenlight”, we can set a 
launch date and begin soliciting establishments for the 
program.

4. Within 45 days of launch, we will engage all city 
establishments that use cooking oil. Participants will display 
the “greasecycle” decal.

5. The collection program will begin in parallel to the solicitation 
period with the first biofuel delivery date for the city targeted 
for 90-120 days after the launch as determined by the city.



 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

NO.    8 DEPT.:  Police DATE: March 28, 2012    

 CONTACT:  William R. Connors, Police Commissioner 
AGENDA ITEM:  Presentation by Police Commissioner 
William R. Connors on the proposed revision of the Rules 
and Regulations of the City of Rye Police Department: 
General Order #121.04.  

 FOR THE MEETING OF:   
 March 28, 2012 

RYE CITY CODE, 
 CHAPTER        
 SECTION       

 

 

 
RECOMMENDATION:   

 

IMPACT:     Environmental    Fiscal    Neighborhood    Other: 

Enhancement of the operational effectiveness of the Department. 

 

 

BACKGROUND:  Commissioner William R. Connors will present on the proposed new General 
Order #121.04 which establishes a Department policy on social media and establishes 
guidelines for its use. Social media can be a potentially valuable means of assisting the 
Department in community outreach, investigative, crime prevention, and other efforts. The 
proposed General Order establishes policies for official use for Department-sanctioned 
communications. In addition, it recognizes the extensive role of social media in the lives of 
many employees, and provides guidelines and precautions for personal use. 

 

The continual growth of social media in our society, as well as incidents involving other police 
departments, has shown the need for implementation of a Department-specific policy. The 
proposal has been developed based on industry-wide best practices. 

 
A copy of the proposed order is attached. It has been provided to the Rye Police Association for 
review pursuant to the provisions of the collective bargaining agreement. 

 















 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

 

NO.   9  DEPT.: City Manager                                                        DATE:  March 28, 2012 

                        CONTACT: Scott Pickup, City Manager 
AGENDA ITEM:  Discussion of the position of City 
Engineer and Public Works Superintendent and the 
upgrade of an existing staff position to Assistant Civil 
Engineer. 

 

 FOR THE MEETING OF:   
 March 28, 2012 

 

 

RECOMMENDATION:   
 

 

IMPACT:     Environmental  Fiscal  Neighborhood  Other:  

 

 
BACKGROUND: The position of City Engineer and Public Works Superintendent has remained 
vacant and the City has been relying on the former City Engineer, working part-time on a 
contract basis, and outside Engineering firms. The Assistant City Engineer has coupled the 
outstanding project management with his existing responsibilities of reviewing storm water 
management plans, compliance with MS-4, sidewalk bid for maintenance and repair, street re-
paving bid, sight distance and engineering support to the Traffic and Pedestrian Safety 
Committee and assisting Public Works in daily operations. The upcoming major capital projects 
scheduled mandate additional staff and expanded duties for the existing staff position. These 
changes will facilitate the timely completion of current and proposed projects. 
 
Capital Projects include: 

 
Bowman Avenue Sluice gate      
Old Post Road Drainage      
Hewlett Avenue Pump Station     
Central Avenue Bridge      
Theodore Fremd Avenue      
FEMA grant LPDM generator      
(Re-submission) for stimulus projects    

EFC grant (Nursery) re-design  

 
 



 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

 

NO.   10  DEPT.: Finance                                                                 DATE:  March 28, 2012 

                        CONTACT: Jean Gribbins, City Comptroller 
AGENDA ITEM:  Resolution to transfer funds from the 
Contingency account and the Building and Vehicles fund, 
to fund the position of City Engineer/Public Works 
Superintendent and upgrade the existing staff position to 
Assistant Civil Engineer. 

 

 FOR THE MEETING OF:   
 March 28, 2012 

 

 

RECOMMENDATION:  That the City Council adopt the following resolution: 
    WHEREAS, City staff has determined that the amounts required for the positions of City 
Engineer/Public Works Superintendent and Assistant Civil Engineer require a change in the  
adopted 2012 budget by $105,000,  and, 

     WHEREAS, the General Fund Contingent Account has a balance of $300,000, now therefore 
be it 

     RESOLVED, that the City Comptroller is authorized to transfer $70,000 from the General 
Fund Contingent Account to the Engineering Department, and  

     WHEREAS, $35,000 of the $602,000 transferred from the General Fund to the Building and 
Vehicle fund for 2009 DPW Vehicle & Equipment Projects has not been spent due to vehicles 
and equipment costing less than budgeted, 

     RESOLVED, that the City Comptroller is authorized to transfer $35,000 from the Building & 
Vehicle Fund to the General Fund Engineering Department.  

 

 

IMPACT:     Environmental  Fiscal  Neighborhood  Other:  

 

 

BACKGROUND: Use and status of the Contingent Account: 

01/01/2012 Beginning balance                                                                  $300,000 

03/28/2012 Transfer to Engineering for staff positions                                (70,000)                

03/28/2012 Balance                                                                                   $230,000 

 

 

 

 
 



 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

NO.   11  DEPT.:  City Manager DATE: March 28, 2012   

 CONTACT:  Scott D. Pickup  
AGENDA ITEM:  Consideration of a request by the Rye 
Little League to approve a parade to kickoff Opening Day 
of the 55th Little League Season on Saturday, April 21, 
2012 beginning at 12:00 p.m.  

 

 FOR THE MEETING OF:   
 March 28, 2012 

RYE CITY CODE, 
 CHAPTER        
 SECTION       

 

 

 

RECOMMENDATION:  That the Council consider granting the request. 

 

IMPACT:     Environmental    Fiscal    Neighborhood    Other: 

 

 

 

BACKGROUND:   
The Rye Little League is requesting the Council approve a parade to kickoff Opening Day of the 
55th Little League Season on Saturday, April 21, 2012 beginning at 12:00 p.m.  

 

 

 

See attached letter from Rye Little League Commissioner Myles P. Lavelle 

 
 





 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

NO.   12  DEPT.:  City Manager DATE: March 28, 2012   

 CONTACT:  Scott D. Pickup  
AGENDA ITEM:  Consideration of a request by the 
Midland Elementary School PTO to approve a parade to 
precede the Midland Elementary School Fair on Saturday, 
April 28, 2012 from 9:00 a.m. to 10:15 a.m.  

 

 FOR THE MEETING OF:   
 March 28, 2012 

RYE CITY CODE, 
 CHAPTER        
 SECTION       

 

 

 

RECOMMENDATION:  That the Council consider granting the request. 

 

IMPACT:     Environmental    Fiscal    Neighborhood    Other: 

 

 

 

BACKGROUND:   
The Midland Elementary School PTO is requesting the Council approve a parade to precede 
the Midland Elementary School Fair on Saturday, April 28, 2012 from 9:00 a.m. to 10:15 a.m.  

 

 
 





 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

NO.   13  DEPT.:  City Manager DATE: March 28, 2012   

 CONTACT:  Scott D. Pickup  
AGENDA ITEM:  Consideration of a request by the Rye 
YMCA for the use of City streets for the 24th Annual Rye 
Derby on Sunday, April 29, 2012 from 9:00 a.m. to 2:00 
p.m.  

 

 FOR THE MEETING OF:   
 March 28, 2012 

RYE CITY CODE, 
 CHAPTER        
 SECTION       

 

 

 

RECOMMENDATION:  That the Council consider granting the request. 

 

IMPACT:     Environmental    Fiscal    Neighborhood    Other: 

 

 

 

BACKGROUND:   
The Rye YMCA is requesting the Council approve their use of City streets for the 24th Annual 
Rye Derby on Sunday, April 29, 2012 from 9:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m.  
 

 

 

 

See attached letter from Gregg Howells, YMCA Executive Director 

 
 







 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

NO.   14  DEPT.:  City Manager DATE: March 28, 2012   

 CONTACT:  Scott D. Pickup  
AGENDA ITEM:  Consideration of a request by the Cystic 
Fibrosis Foundation for the use of City streets for the 24th 
Annual Great Strides Walk on Sunday, May 20, 2012 
from 9:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m.  

 

 FOR THE MEETING OF:   
 March 28, 2012 

RYE CITY CODE, 
 CHAPTER        
 SECTION       

 

 

 

RECOMMENDATION:  That the Council consider granting the request. 

 

IMPACT:     Environmental    Fiscal    Neighborhood    Other: 

 

 

 

BACKGROUND:   
The Cystic Fibrosis Foundation is requesting the Council approve their use of City streets for 
the 24th Annual Great Strides Walk on Sunday, May 20, 2012 from 9:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m.  
 

 

 

 

See attached letter from Patti Massa, Director of Development for the Cystic Fibrosis 
Foundation  
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